
Item Description Qty. Unit  Unit Price  Extended 
Price  Unit Price  Extended 

Price  Unit Price  Extended 
Price  Unit Price  Extended 

Price 

1 9 mm Training Ammuniton (see attached 
specifications) 475,000 EA  $          0.245  $     116,375.00  $          0.275  $     130,625.00 

2 9 mm Duty Ammunition (see attached 
specifications) 70,000 EA  No Bid  $          0.435  $       30,450.00 

3 .40 Training Ammunition 110,000 EA  $          0.284  $       31,240.00  $          0.410  $       45,100.00 
4 .223 Training Ammunition 285,000 EA  $          0.398  $     113,430.00  $          0.500  $     142,500.00 

5
.223 Duty Ammunition Speer Gold Dot 
55g GDSP (#24446), Federal Tactical 55g 
BSP (#LE223T1) No Substitutions

70,000 EA  No Bid  $          0.840  $       58,800.00 

6
.308 Winchester Duty Ammnition .308 
Win Hornay 168 GR A-MAX TAP 
(#80965) (same lot) No Substitutions

6,000 EA  No Bid  $          1.650  $         9,900.00 

7
12 Gauge Duty Slug Ammunition 
Brenneke - Classic (1 1/8 oz. Slug & 2 
3/4' Shell) Product Code 120 18 20 
Symbol SL-122CLM No Substitutions

1,000 EA  No Bid  $          2.100  $         2,100.00 

8
9x19 mm Non-lethal training ammunition 
Loud Simunition 9mm  FX Marking 
Cartridges (#5320761, 5320762, 
5320765) No Substitution

20,000 EA  No Bid  $          1.050  $       21,000.00 

9
9 x 19 mm Blank Training Ammunition 
Loud Simunition 9mm Securiblank 
ammunition Loud (PN#530600) No 
Substitutions

3,000 EA  No Bid  $          0.900  $         2,700.00 

10
5.56 mm Non-lethal Training Ammunition 
Simunition 5.56 Non-lethal Marking 
Cartridges (5360141, 5360142)

20,000 EA  No Bid  $          1.300  $       26,000.00 

11
5.56 mm Blank Training Ammuniton 
Simunition 5.56 SecuriBlank Ammunition 
Loud (#5358319)

1,000 EA  No Bid  $          1.300  $         1,300.00 

12 .38 Special Blanks 500 EA  $          0.871  $            435.50  $          1.400  $            700.00 
13 .308 Winchester Blanks 200 EA  No Bid  No Bid 

PAYMENT TERMS Net 30 Net 30

2023B030 Furnish Ammunition  Date: April 4, 2023 Time: 9:30 A.M. 

Preliminary Abstract
Vendor # 1 Vendor # 2

Local Bidder NO YES

Vendor # 3 Vendor # 4

Dooley Enterprises Northern Security
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